
MINUTES OF A SPECIAL 
MEETING

BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF 
THE MADRID COMMUNITY 

SCHOOL DISTRICT
TUESDAY, OCTOBER 26, 2021
I. Call to Order
The Board of Directors for the 

Madrid Community School District 
met for a special meeting on Tues-
day, October 26, 2021 in the Madrid 
Administration Office. Meeting was 
called to order by President Lauren 
Clark at 5:30pm.

II. Roll Call
Members present Allie An-

tonovich, Chelcie Badgley, Lauren 
Clark, Tyler Simmons and Jessica 
Smith. Superintendent Brian Horn, 
Board Secretary Kris Van Pelt, Prin-
cipal Kelly Williamson, Activities Di-
rector Justin Johnson and two other 
guests were also in attendance.

III. Hearing Concerning the Rec-
ommended Discipline of a Student 
(Closed Session - Iowa Code Sec-
tion 21.5(1)(e) and Iowa Code Sec-
tion 21.5(1)(a)

Moved by Antonovich the Board 
conduct a hearing to consider dis-
ciplinary action against a student 
as provided by Iowa Code Section 
21.5(1)(e) and to review and discuss 
records which are required by state 
or federal law to be kept confidential 
as provided by Iowa Code Section 
21.5(1)(a). Seconded by Simmons. 
Roll call: Badgley, Simmons, Smith, 
Antonovich, Clark. Motion carried 
5-0. The board entered into closed 
session at 5:32pm.

The Board returned to open ses-
sion at 6:45pm.

IV. Action Regarding Recom-
mended Discipline of a Student

Moved by Antonovich that the 
Board accept the superintendent’s 
recommendation, with the following 
amendments:

• That the student who was the 
subject of the disciplinary hearing be 
expelled from attendance in the Ma-
drid Community School District and 
any school activities for the duration 
of the original suspension, through 
December 6, 2021.

• That upon completion of the 
expulsion period, an application for 
re-admission must be submitted and 
approved by the superintendent pri-

or to re-admission on November 29, 
2021.

• At the family’s own expense, 
the Student must successfully show 
proof of a scheduled appointment 
for a substance abuse evaluation 
by November 29, 2021. The student 
must show proof of completion of a 
substance abuse evaluation and, if 
appropriate partake in any therapy 
or treatment program recommended 
by the substance abuse evaluation. 
Proof of attendance of said evalua-
tion, must be submitted no later than 
April 26, 2022. If not received the 
board will review for further action 
and possible additional expulsion at 
the end of the six (6) month period. 
Documentation of participation and 
completion (if applicable) must be 
verified by information received by 
the Superintendent directly from the 
organization overseeing the Stu-
dent’s treatment. The Student and 
Parent agree that any recommenda-
tions regarding additional conditions 
for readmission that are made by 
the Student’s therapist or program 
shall be binding and are incorporat-
ed herein by reference.

• That the Student must have 
no additional violations, arrests, or 
charges through the date of read-
mission.

• That written findings and con-
clusions consistent with the Board’s 
deliberations will be prepared and 
the President is authorized and di-
rected to execute the Findings of 
Fact and Conclusion.

The motion was seconded by 
Simmons. Roll call: Smith, An-
tonovich, Badgley, Simmons, Clark. 
Motion carried 5-0.

V. Adjournment
There was no further business to 

come before the Board for consid-
eration at this time. Moved by Sim-
mons, second by Badgley to adjourn 
the meeting. Roll call: Antonovich, 
Badgley, Simmons, Smith, Clark. 
Motion carried 5-0. President Clark 
adjourned the meeting at 6:57pm.

Reports, documents and full text 
of motions, resolutions or policies 
considered at this meeting are on 
file in the Board Secretary’s Office.

Lauren Clark, President
Kris Van Pelt, Board Secretary

PUBLIC NOTICE
Madrid School 10.26.21

Published in the Madrid Register-News on Wednesday, Nov. 3, 2021


